CHAPTER SEVEN

Revisions:
2014-01 06/03/2014 Revising Chapter Seven (BUILDING REGULATIONS); Add Articles 3, 4, 5 and 6.

2015-13 10/20-2015 
CHAPTER SEVEN

BUILDING REGULATIONS

ARTICLE 1:  CODE ADOPTIONS
SEC. 7-1-1:  Adoption of Building and Residential Codes

(A)
IBC adoption.  The 2012 edition of the International Building Code, as published by the International Code Council, Inc. including specifically Appendices C, F, H and I thereof, is hereby adopted as the Building Code for the City.  It is incorporated by reference as if fully set out in this Article, with the additions, insertions, deletions and changes described in Section 7-1-2 of the Knoxville Municipal Code.


(B)
IRC adoption.  The 2012 edition of the International Residential Code for One and Two-Family Dwellings, including specifically Appendices A, B, C, D, E, G (except subsection 9 in Section AG105 of Appendix G), H, I, J, K and L thereof, is hereby adopted as the Residential Code for the City.  It is incorporated by reference as if fully set out in this Article, with the additions, insertions, deletions and changes described in Section 7-1-3 of the Knoxville Municipal Code.


(C)
State Codes adoption.  The 2012 edition of the International Residential Code for One and Two-Family Dwellings, including specifically Appendices A, B, C, D, E, G (except subsection 9 in Section AG105 of Appendix G), H, I, J, K and L thereof, is hereby adopted as the Residential Code for the City.  It is incorporated by reference as if fully set out in this subchapter, with the additions, insertions, deletions and changes described in Section 7-1-3 of the Knoxville Municipal Code.

SEC. 7-1-2:  Amendments to the International Building Code

The 2012 edition of the International Building Code is amended in the following respects.


(1)
At Section 101.1, delete the words [name of jurisdiction] and insert the words “City of Knoxville, Knox County, Illinois, a municipal corporation.”


(2)
At Section 109.2, add the words:

“a.
Residential garages (attached or detached), $0.10 per square foot.

b.
Single-family and two-family residences, finishing basement/converting garage/attic to living space, $0.05 per square foot.

c.
Single-family and two-family residences (not including basement unless split foyer or finished for living space), $0.15 per square foot.

d.
Single-family and two-family residences (unfinished basement), $0.10 per square foot.

e.
Multifamily residential buildings (not including basement unless finished for living space), $15.00 for first $1,000 cost and $5.00 for each additional $1,000 or fraction thereof.

f.
Commercial and institutional buildings (when finished for retail or office use), $15.00 for first $1,000 cost and $5.00 for each additional $1,000 or fraction thereof.

g.
Warehouses and industrial buildings (when primarily unfinished), $15.00 for the first $1,000 cost and $5.00 for each additional $1,000 or fraction thereof.

h.
Nonresidential change of use or remodel, $15.00 for first $1,000 cost and $5.00 for each additional $1,000 or fraction thereof.

i.
Residential decks/ramps/porches, $0.10 per square foot.

j.
Fence, $25.00 per permit.

k.
Pool, $25.00 per permit.

l.
Utility sheds (less than 150 square feet), $25.00 per permit.”


(3)
Reserved.


(4)
At Section 101.4.1, amend by revising the first sentence to read as follows:

“The provisions of the currently adopted edition of the International Fuel Gas Code shall apply to the installation of gas piping from the point of deliver, gas appliances and related accessories as covered in this Code.”


(5)
At Section 101.4.3, change “International Plumbing Code” to “current version of Illinois State Plumbing Code” and amend last sentence to read as follows:

“The provisions of the current edition of the State of Illinois Private Sewage Disposal Licensing Act and Code, as published by the Illinois Department of Public Health and the Knox County Health Ordinance, Article IV Private Sewage Disposal shall apply to private sewage disposal systems.”


(6)
The Building Code is hereby amended by deleting therefrom, Sections 105.1.1 and 105.1.2.


(7)
Section 105.2 of the Building Code is hereby amended by deleting items 1 and 2, renumbering the remaining items and by deleting therefrom, Section 105.2, Electrical.


(8)
The Building Code is hereby amended by deleting therefrom, Section 107.3.1.


(9)
The Building Code is hereby amended by deleting therefrom, Section 110.3.7.


(10)
At Section 113, delete this Section in its entirety and insert, instead, the following:

“Any person shall have the right to appeal a decision of the Code Official to the Overall Code Review Commission, as established in Chapter 33 of the Knoxville Municipal Code.”


(11)
At Chapter 11, delete the text of this Chapter in its entirety.  Insert, instead, the following:

“The Environmental Barriers Act, ILCS Ch. 410, Act 25, §§ 1, et seq., is incorporated by reference as if fully set out in this Ordinance.”


(12)
At Chapter 13, delete this Chapter in its entirety.


(13)
The Building Code is hereby amended by deleting therefrom, Section 1510.3, Exception (2) and Section 1510.4, Roof Recovering.


(14)
At Section 1809.5, amend by revising the first sentence to read as follows:

“Except in compliance with the Knoxville Municipal Code in regards to Utility Sheds, Floating Concrete Slabs, and Existing Floating Slabs, or where otherwise protected from frost, foundation walls, piers and other permanent supports of buildings and structures shall be protected from frost by one or more of the following methods:”


(15)
At Chapter 29, delete this Chapter in its entirety.


(16)
At Section 3109.4.1.8, delete this Section in its entirety.


(17)
At Chapter 32, delete this Chapter in its entirety.


(18)
The Building Code is hereby amended by deleting therefrom, Section 3307, Protection of Adjoining Property.


(19)
The Building Code is hereby amended by deleting therefrom, Sections H101.2, Item (4), H104.1, H106.1.1, H109.1, H109.2, H110.3, H110.4, H110.5, H114, Table 4-A, and Table 4-B.


(20)
The Building Code is hereby amended by deleting therefrom, the fourth sentence from Section H110.1.


(21)
At Section H112.1, amend by revising the first sentence to read as follows:

“Projecting signs shall be securely attached to a building or structure by metal supports such as bolts, anchors, supports, chains, guys, or steel rods.”


(22)
At Section 1612.3, delete the words “[insert name of jurisdiction],” and insert, instead, the words “the City of Knoxville, Illinois”; and delete the words “[insert date of issuance]” and insert, instead, the words “December 19, 1984.”


(23)
Reserved.


(24)
At Section 3412.2, delete the words “[date to be inserted by the jurisdiction.  Note:  it is recommended that this date coincide with effective date of building codes within the jurisdiction],” and insert the words “June 16, 2016.”

SEC. 7-1-3:  Amendments to the International Residential Code

The 2012 edition of the International Residential Code for One and Two-Family Dwellings is amended in the following respects.


(1)
Section R101.1 is hereby revised to include, “City of Knoxville” in the place of “[Name of Jurisdiction].”


(2)
Section R105.2 of the Residential Code is hereby amended by deleting items 1 and 2 and renumbering remaining items.


(3)
Section R301.2 of the Residential Code is hereby amended by completing Table R301.2(1) as follows:

“Ground Snow Load – 20 pounds per square foot

Wind Speed (mph) – 75 miles per hour

Seismic Design Category – Zone B

Subject to Damage From:

Weathering – Severe

Frost Line Depth – 36 inches

Termite – Yes, moderate to heavy

Winter Design Temp – Minus 4

Ice Barrier Underlayment Required – Yes

Flood Hazard – Flood insurance rate map (FIRM) and flood boundary floodway map (FBFM), effective date June 19, 1985

Air Freezing Index – 1500

Mean Annual Temp – 50 degrees Fahrenheit.”


(4)
Section R302.1 of the Residential Code is hereby amended, so that as amended, the first sentence of the third Exception shall read as follows:

“Tool and storage sheds, playhouses and similar structures that are less than 150 square feet are not required to provide wall protection based on the location on the lot.”


(4.1)
The fourth Exception contained in Section 302.1 of the Residential Code is amended to read as follows:

“Detached garages accessory to a dwelling shall be permitted to be located 3 feet from the property line with a 0 hour fire-resistance rating.  Any portion of an accessory garage located less than 3 feet from the property line shall have a 1-hour fire-resistance rating.  Detached garages accessory to a dwelling located within 2 feet of a lot line are permitted to have roof eave protections not exceeding 4 inches.”


(4.2)
Section R302.1 of the Residential Code is amended by adding thereto the following exception:

“6.
All detached accessory structures must have a 4-foot minimum separation between the exterior walls.”


(5)
Section R403 of the Residential Code is hereby amended by adding the following provisions regarding Figure R403.1(1):

“a.
For masonry foundation walls, the footings shall be a minimum of sixteen (16) inches wide and eight (8) inches deep;

b.
Poured concrete trenches shall be a minimum of eight (8) inches wide for single story accessory structures utilizing frost footings; and shall meet the bearing width as required in Table R403.1 for 1 story, 2 story and 3 story dwellings and accessory structures with over 1 story;

c.
When an addition is being constructed to a structure with a footing depth of less than thirty-six (36) inches, the new addition must still comply with the thirty-six (36) inch frost footing requirements.”


(6)
The Residential Code is hereby amended by adding thereto the following Section:

“Sec. R409, Utility Sheds.
Permanent foundations are not required for utility sheds of one hundred fifty (150) square feet or less with a height or eight (8) feet or less.  Utility sheds with no permanent foundation, however, must have a floor of one of the following:

Pressure-treated wood, metal, concrete, asphalt, brick, rock or gravel.  Such utility sheds must also be properly anchored in one of the following manners:

Bolting into concrete, screw anchors at each corner of the shed, or an approved equal.  Skids shall be permitted to remain under a utility shed.”


(7)
The Residential Code is hereby amended by adding thereto the following Section:

“Sec. R506.2.5, Floating Concrete Slabs.
A floating concrete slab may be utilized in one-story accessory buildings, provided:

a.
The slab covers an area of one thousand (1,000) square feet or less;

b.
A lug eight (8) inches in width is constructed around the perimeter of the slab which extends at least eight (8) inches below the top of said slab;

c.
The slab and lug consists of a continuous pour of concrete;

d.
No water or sewer lines serve the building;

e.
The building is securely anchored to the slab through an approved fashion; and

f.
A pressure-treated bottom plate is used on all concrete slab installations, including those utilizing a curb.”


(8)
The Residential Code is hereby amended by adding thereto the following Section:

“Sec. R506.2.6, Existing Floating Slabs.
An existing floating slab may be utilized in the construction of a new accessory building, provided the existing slab meets the approval of the Building Official.  In the event a new section of concrete is to be added on to an existing floating slab, the following requirements shall be met:

a.
The existing slab must meet the approval of the Building Official;

b.
The new section of concrete shall be tied to the existing slab by one-half (1/2) inch reinforcement bars placed eighteen (18) inches on center and run six (6) inches into the existing slab and eighteen (18) inches into the area to be poured; and

c.
All of the requirements under Section R506.2.5, except item c., shall be followed.”


(9)
The Residential Code is hereby amended by deleting therefrom, Section 907.3, Exception (2) and Section R907.4, Roof Recovering.


(10)
Section R1001.11 of the Residential Code is hereby amended by adding thereto the following:

“Exceptions:


5.
Steel studs with zero (0) inch clearance may be utilized in lieu of wood or combustible framing with the two (2) inch clearance.”


(11)
Section R1006.1 of the Residential Code is hereby amended, so that as amended, it shall read as follows:

“Factory-built or masonry fireplaces covered in this Chapter may be equipped with an exterior air supply to assure proper fuel combustion unless the room is mechanically ventilated and controlled so that the indoor pressure is neutral or positive.”


(12)
The Residential Code is hereby amended by deleting therefrom, Part IV, Energy Conservation, which includes Chapter 11.


(13)
Reserved.


(14)
The Residential Code is hereby amended by deleting therefrom, Section M1305.1.1.


(15)
Section M1601.1.2 of the Residential Code is hereby amended by deleting “or shall be completely encased in concrete not less than 2 inches (51 mm) thick” from the sixth and seventh lines.


(16)
Section M1601.4.1 of the Residential Code is hereby amended, so that as amended, the last sentence of the second paragraph shall read as follows:

“Crimp joints for round ducts shall have a contact lap of at least one and one-half (1-1/2) inches and shall be mechanically fastened by means of at least two (2) sheet metal screws, or rivets equally spaced around the joint, or an equivalent fastening method.”


(17)
Section M1602.2(4) of the Residential Code is hereby amended, so that as amended, it shall read as follows:

“(4)
A closet, bathroom, toilet room, garage, mechanical room, furnace room, or other dwelling unit.”


(18)
Reserved.


(19)
Section M2005.1 of the Residential Code is hereby amended, so that as amended, the first sentence shall read as follows:

“Water heaters shall be labeled and shall be installed in accordance with the manufacturer’s installation instructions and the Illinois State Plumbing Code.”


(20)
Section M2101.1 of the Residential Code is hereby amended by revising Table M2101.1 to include a footnote 5 to read as follows:

“Type M copper tubing shall only be used above ground.”


(21)
Section M2101.3 of the Residential Code is hereby amended, so that as amended, it shall read as follows:

“The potable water system shall be protected from backflow in accordance with the most current Illinois State Plumbing Code.”


(22)
The Residential Code is hereby amended by deleting therefrom, Section M2101.4.


(23)
The Residential Code is hereby amended by deleting therefrom, Section M2101.7.


(24)
Section G2414 of the Residential Code is hereby amended by deleting Section G2414.5.2, Copper Tubing, to eliminate copper tubing and copper pipe from use as allowed, natural gas supply piping materials, interior and exterior.


(25)
Section G2448.1 of the Residential Code is hereby amended, so that as amended, it shall read as follows:

“Water heaters shall be tested in accordance with ANSI Z21.10.1 and ANSI Z21.10.3, and waters heaters shall be labeled and shall be installed in accordance with the manufacturer’s installation instructions and the Illinois State Plumbing Code.”


(26)
The Residential Code is hereby amended by deleting therefrom, Part VII, Plumbing, which includes Chapters 25, 26, 27, 28, 29, 30, 31, 32, and 33.”


(27)
Section AI101.1 in Appendix I of the Residential Code is hereby amended, so that as amended, it shall read as follows:

“AI101.1  Scope.  

Private sewage disposal systems shall conform to the current edition of the State of Illinois Private Sewage Disposal Licensing Act and Code, as published by the Illinois Department of Public Health and the Knox County Health Ordinance, Article IV, Private Sewage Disposal.”


(28)
Section AG109 in Appendix G of the Residential Code is hereby amended by the addition of the following subsection:

“AG1-9 Locations.  

Private swimming pools shall not encroach on any front or side yard required by this Code or by the governing zoning law, unless in accordance with specific rules of the jurisdiction in which the pool is located.  A wall of a swimming pool shall not be located less than 6 feet from any rear or side property line and must maintain the required front yard setback off any street side property line.”


(29)
The Residential Code is hereby amended by adding thereto, the following subsection:

“R405.2.4.

A sump pit, a minimum of 18 inches in diameter by 22 inches deep shall be installed in all new construction crawl spaces that are not attached to a basement.”

SEC. 7-1-4:  Tracer Wires

1. When a new water or sewer connection is installed, or an existing water or sewer connection is uncovered, renovated or modified, and said connection consists of PVC or plastic or like materials, the water, sewer or gas connection shall have a continuous, solid 12 gauge or larger sheathed coated, suitable for direct burial tracer wire with one end brought out in an accessible location.  
2. No work to install, modify, uncover, renovate or modify a water or sewer connection shall be covered until the Building Administrator or his or her deputy confirms compliance with this Section.  In addition to, or in lieu of, denying coverage of such work, the City may seek all other remedies provided by law or ordinance, including the penalties provided under Sec. 1-1-11 of the Knoxville City Code. 

3. A copy of this Section shall be provided to every contractor or Owner who seeks a permit to install, modify, uncover, renovate or modify a water or sewer connection.  Notwithstanding any provision to the contrary, the failure of the City to provide such a copy of this Section shall not constitute as a defense to a violation of this Section.
ARTICLE 2:  Permits, Fees, Etc.
SEC. 7-2-1:  Building Permit
The following types of structures do not require a City Building permit:  buildings of 100 square feet or less on skids; and open decks or steps not attached to any building.  Also, such items except steps are to be placed in back yards only.  They are not required to meet the set-back requirements of the City’s zoning ordinance but shall be placed far enough from the property line so as to permit use and maintenance without encroaching on adjoining property.  (Added 12-6-2000)

The following types of structures are included among those requiring a permit prior to construction:  open decks attached to a residence or other building; any structure having a roof (with or without side enclosures); any building on skids over 100 square feet and any movable structure placed on a fixed foundation.  All such structures shall conform to provisions of this Chapter of the Knoxville City Code and shall conform to the City of Knoxville Zoning Ordinance with respect to structure height, lot coverage, number of stories, floor area ratio, distance between buildings and minimum set-back requirements.  (Added 12-6-2000)

Any person who desires to construct a new building, or modify an existing building so as to increase any exterior dimension(s), shall apply directly (or through an authorized representative) for a City building permit (Reference Appendix B Sec. 7-2-1-A) from the Building Administrator (or other authorized representative of the City) prior to beginning any part of the construction work.  The Building Administrator shall require such information, including items such as a scale drawing of the lot showing the outline of the building or enlargement and its placement on said lot, set-back dimensions, specific description of the proposed building relative to type of structure, number of stories, roof design and/or any other items specified in the BOCA National Building Code under the section regarding application for permit.  The Building Administrator (or other representative of the City who is authorized to issue building permits) shall determine whether such proposed building or enlargement will comply with all the provisions of the City Zoning Ordinance.

If the Building Administrator (or other authorized representative of the City) determines that the proposed building or enlargement is in full compliance with the applicable provisions of the City Zoning Ordinance, he/she shall issue the building permit subject to the payment of the appropriate fee as stipulated in this article.

If the Building Administrator (or other authorized representative of the City) determines that the proposed building or enlargement will not fully conform to the applicable provisions of the City Zoning Ordinance, he/she shall not issue a building permit until such time that the necessary revisions of the proposed plans are made to fully comply, or a variance to the Zoning Ordinance which authorizes the non-compliance has been officially granted by the City Council.

SEC.  7-2-2:  Building and Other Permit Fees
The City Council, from time to time, shall establish building permit fees for the following types of buildings (Reference Appendix A SEC.  7-2-2-A):

(1) Residential garages (attached or detached),

(2) Residences (not including basement unless split foyer and affording living space),

(3) Commercial buildings (when finished for retail or office use),

(4) Warehouses (when primarily unfinished inside or of the pole type),

(5) Any attached appurtenance to any of the above-described buildings

  (6)
Fence construction (Added 12-6-2000)

  (7) 
Swimming pool construction (Added 12-6-2000)

  (8)
Attached deck or porch (Added 12-6-2000)

  (9)
Building on skids over 100 square feet (Added 12-6-2000)

  (10)
Movable structure on fixed foundation (Added 12-6-2000), and/or

(11)
Any other type of building determined as necessary or appropriate subsequent to the adoption of this chapter.

SEC.  7-2-3:  Enforcement of Building Permits
Any construction which is commenced or completed without a building permit including either an initial building permit or a replacement building permit), when said permit is required under this chapter, is a violation of this Chapter punishable under the provisions of Section 7-5-1.  Each day that construction is conducted, or construction is left in an incomplete condition, without a building permit shall constitute a separate violation.

The Building Administrator (or other authorized representative of the City) may send written notice (Reference Appendix B SEC. 7-2-3-A) to the owner or person in possession of the premises that a permit is required.  The decision to issue such notice, however, shall be at the sole discretion of the Building Administrator (or other authorized representative of the City) and shall not be prerequisite to the imposition of penalties under the provisions of Section 7-5-1 or the issuance of an Administrative Warning Ticket under the provisions of Section 7-5-4.

The provisions contained in this section shall be in addition to all other remedies available to the City for the failure to obtain any required building permit. 

SEC.  7-2-4:  Demolition or Removal Permit
Before any residential type building or other type principal building may be demolished in whole or in part, or removed by any means from a particular parcel of real property within the City of Knoxville, the owner (or his/her authorized representative) shall secure a demolition or relocation permit (Reference Appendix B SEC. 7-2-4-A) from the City through the Building Administrator (or other authorized representative of the City) and pay the stipulated fee therefor.  The person who secures a demolition or removal permit from the City shall be responsible for notifying each utility having a service connection to the building to be demolished or removed and having each such service properly shut off or disconnected prior to beginning the demolition or removal of that building.

SEC.  7-2-5:  Demolition or Removal Permit Fees
The demolition or removal permit fee shall be established by City Council resolution from time to time (Reference Appendix A SEC. 7-2-5-A).

SEC.  7-2-6:  Enforcement of Demolition and Removal Permits
The provisions of SEC. 7-2-3 regarding the enforcement of building permits shall also be applicable for any demolition or removal of a building for which a permit is required under this chapter.

SEC.  7-2-7:  Expiration of Permits
Any initial building permit issued under the provisions of this Chapter shall expire if any stage of construction is not completed within the respective time limit following the date the permit is issued:  (1) Building construction to begin within six months; and (2) completion of outside of building within 12 months.  Non-completion of any phase of the 

construction process within the respective time period will require a replacement permit at the then current rate for an initial permit.  If a second replacement permit is needed the fee shall be the then current rate for an initial permit plus $500.  If an application for a replacement permit is not received by the City within 15 days after the notice provided for in this Article (Reference Appendix B, Section 7-2-3-B) is mailed, failure to acquire a permit will fall under the provisions of Section 7-2-3.  (Revised 12-6-2000)

Any initial demolition or removal permit issued under the provisions of this Chapter shall expire 12 months from the date of issue.  If the demolition or removal is not completed within that time a replacement permit shall be required at the then current fee which also shall expire in 12 months.  Failure to acquire replacement permit following notification (Reference Appendix B, Section 7-2-3-B) shall be processed under the provisions of Section 7-2-3.  (Revised 12-6-2000)

SEC.  7-2-8:  Fences (Revised 7-7-2008)

A permit is required for the construction of a fence within the City.

All fences shall conform to the height and location requirements of Sections 31-3-36, 37 and 38 of the Knoxville Municipal Code.  In addition, any fence shall be (1) placed far enough inside the property line to permit construction/erection and maintenance of the side next to the property line without encroaching on the adjoining property except as provided below, and (2) constructed so that the finished side faces toward the adjoining property with the supporting structure side facing the interior of the fenced property.  (Revised 7-7-08)

A chain link or maintenance free type fence may be placed on the property line in either of the following situations:  (1) the cost of the fence is being shared by the two adjoining property owners, or 2) the cost is not being shared but the adjoining property owner(s) provides the City with written permission for locating the fence on the property line. (Revised 7-7-08).

Any fence in existence as of December 6, 2000 which is subsequently replaced shall be constructed/erected in accordance with the provisions of this section. (Revised 7-7-08).

SEC.  7-2-9:  Fence Permit (Added 12-6-2000)

If the building administrator (or other authorized representative of the City) determines that the proposed fence is in full compliance with the applicable provisions of Section 7-2-8 the permit shall be issued subject to the payment of the permit fee as stipulated in this article.

If the proposed fence does not comply with the necessary provisions no permit shall be issued until the proposed fence does comply unless the City Council grants a variance.

A fence permit shall expire in six months from date of issue if construction of the fence is not completed.  A replacement permit for extension of time shall be required at the same charge as an initial permit at the current fee and shall be for the same length of 

time.  Failure to acquire any permit following notice (Reference Appendix B, Section 7-2-3-A or B) shall be processed under the provisions of Section 7-2-3.

SEC.  7-2-10:  Fence Permit Fee  (Added 12-6-2000)

The City Council, from time to time, by resolution shall establish a fence permit fee (Reference Appendix A, Section 7-2-2-A).

SEC.  7-2-11:  Swimming Pools  (Revised 7-7-2008)
(1) A private swimming pool (“pool”) is a man-made, rigid or semi-rigid receptacle for water having a depth at any point greater than eighteen inches (18”), used or intended to be used for swimming, wading or bathing and constructed, installed or maintained above or below the ground, which is used exclusively by the owner or occupant of the lot or premises in the City, his family and his guests.  A private swimming pool will include a pool, hot tub or spa.

(2) An in-ground pool is classified as a permanent structure.  An above ground

      pool is classified as a semi-permanent structure.  Both type pools require a

      permit prior to construction/erection, and shall meet the setback requirements

      for buildings.   (Revised 7-7-08)

(3) Private pools, hot tubs and spas, containing water shall be completely surrounded by a fence or barrier at least forty-eight (48) inches in height above the finished ground level measured on the side of the barrier away

from the pool.  Gates and doors in such barriers shall be self-closing and self-

latching.  Where the self-latching device is less than fifty-four (54) inches above the bottom of the gate the release mechanism shall be located on the pool side of the gate. Self-closing and self-latching gates shall be maintained such that the gate will positively close and latch when released from an open position of six (6) inches from the gatepost.  No existing pool enclosure shall be removed, replaced or changed in a manner that reduces its effectiveness as a safety barrier.

(4) When a private swimming pool is constructed to a height equal to or greater than forty eight inches (48”) above ground level and is so constructed that the pool itself is an effective barrier to small children so as to prohibit any access to such pool, then the requirements of this subsection for fences may be waived.  Any ladders used for access to the pool shall be of a locking type or shall be removable so as to prevent the accessibility of small children.

(5) Pool, Hot Tub, Spa Covers:  In the event that the owner of a private temporary or permanent  swimming pool, hot tub or spa does not enclose the pool in the manner provided above, at any time that the pool remains unattended, the owner shall provide a cover for the pool, hot tub or spa and the cover shall be:

a. Of a rigid construction capable of supporting a weight of not 

less than one hundred fifty (150) pounds at its center.

b. Locked and secured to the sides of the pool, hot tub or spa so as to

prevent the use of the pool, hot tub or spa.

(6) When any private temporary or permanent swimming pool, hot tub or spa remains unattended, all movable furniture, ladders, equipment and any other objects capable of being drawn to the side of the pool, hot tub or spa area shall be removed from the surrounding enclosure.  Such means of access shall be stored in a secure place and in such a manner so as to prevent same from being used to gain access to the pool, hot tub or spa enclosure.

SEC.  7-2-12:  Swimming Pool Permit  (Revised 7-7-2008)


If the Building Administrator (or other authorized representative of the City) determines

that the proposed pool location conforms to the building setback requirements the permit shall be issued subject to the payment of the permit fee as provided in this chapter. The pool permit shall include the enclosing fence as required by this chapter.  If the pool is the self standing type with no other means of support for the outer perimeter than compressed air pressure, or if the pool is designed so that it must be emptied for the winter, then the permit fee shall be the same as established by the City Council for a fence permit and include the enclosing fence.

If the proposed pool location does not comply with the setback requirements no permit shall be issued and the pool shall not be constructed/erected until the requirements are met or a variance has been granted by the City Council and a permit has been issued.

An initial pool permit shall expire if construction/erection is not completed within six months from the date of issue.  A replacement permit for an extension of time shall be required for the same length of time at the then current permit fee.  Failure to acquire any permit following notification (Reference Appendix B, Section 7-2-3-A or B) shall be processed under the provisions of Section 7-2-3.  (Revised 7-7-08)

SEC. 7-2-13 Swimming Pool Permit Fee

The City Council, from time to time, by resolution shall establish a swimming pool permit fee (Reference Appendix A., Section 7-2-2-A).

SEC.  7-2-14:  Protection of the City  (Renumbered 12-6-2000)

Any person responsible for any building, demolition or removal activity within the City of Knoxville shall be responsible for holding the City harmless in the event of any accident connected with such project, regardless of whether a permit is required under this chapter.  Precautionary measures to assure compliance with this section would include, but not necessarily be limited to, erecting a fence around the property and/or securing insurance.

Any person who disregards his/her responsibility to hold the City harmless as required under this chapter shall be subject to suit by the City.

SEC. 7-2-15:  Certificate of Occupancy and Compliance

Upon completion of work for which a building permit has been issued as provided herein, the Knoxville Building Administrator (or other authorized representative of the City) shall inspect the premises, and if the work has been completed in accordance with the ordinance of the City, shall issue a Certificate of Occupancy and Compliance in a form approved by the City.  (Reference Appendix B, Sect 7-2-15A).  A record of all Certificates of Occupancy and Compliance shall be kept on file in the City Offices, and copies shall be furnished on request to any person holding a propriety or tenancy interest in the premises, or in a building affected by such Certificate of Occupancy or Compliance.

ARTICLE 3:  Unsafe Buildings and Residences
SEC. 7-3-1:  Definition of Unsafe Building

For the purpose of this Chapter, unsafe building shall mean any building, shed, fence or any other structure which, because of its:

(1)
General condition, or


(2)
Faulty or partial construction, or


(3)
Inadequate maintenance, or


(4)
Dilapidation or deterioration, or


(5)
Lack of adequate doors or windows, or


(6)
Abandonment, or


(7)
Partial demolition or destruction, or


(8)
Any other cause, is

(a)
Dangerous to the public health, and may cause or aid in the spread of disease or injury to the occupants thereof or of neighboring buildings; or

(b)
Especially liable to fire, and constitutes or creates a fire hazard; or

(c)
Especially liable to cause injury or damage by collapsing or by a collapse or fall of any part of such structure, or is otherwise structurally unsafe; or

(d)
Available to and frequented by vagrants, transients, malefactors or disorderly persons, who are not lawful occupants of such structure.

SEC. 7-3-2:  Declared a Nuisance


Any unsafe building within the City is hereby declared to be a nuisance, and all such buildings shall be abated by repair, rehabilitation, demolition or removal in accordance with the provisions of this Chapter.

Nothing in this Chapter shall be construed as limiting any condition on land to also be declared a nuisance under the provisions of the “Nuisance Code of the City of Knoxville” (Chapter 15 of the Knoxville Municipal Code).

SEC. 7-3-3:  To Allow Unsafe Buildings Declared Unlawful

It shall be unlawful for any person to permit the existence of any unsafe building within the City; and it shall be unlawful for the owner, occupant or person in control of any unsafe building to permit the same to remain in an unsafe condition, or to occupy such building or permit the same to be occupied while it is or remains in an unsafe condition.
SEC. 7-3-4:  Inspection; Notice to Abate, Notice to Vacate

(a) The Building Administrator shall examine or cause to be examined every building or structure reported to be unsafe, and whenever, upon due investigation, the Building Administrator shall be of the opinion that any building or structure in the City is an unsafe building, he shall file a written statement to this effect with the City Clerk.

(b) The City Clerk shall thereupon cause due notice in writing to be served upon the owner or owners of such building or structure, stating that the building has been declared to be in an unsafe condition, setting forth the causes therefor, and that such unsafe condition must be removed or remedied by repairing or altering the building or structure or by demolishing or removing the same.  Such notice shall require the owner or person in control of the building or structure to commence the required repairs, improvement, demolition or removal of the building or structure, and all such work shall be completed within fifteen (15) days of the date of such notice, unless for special reasons stated a longer time is allowed, but in no case to exceed one hundred twenty (120) days.


(c) Should the conditions require, for reasons of public welfare and safety, such notice shall also require the building or structure to be vacated immediately and not reoccupied until the required repairs or improvements are completed, the building inspected and final approval given by Building Administrator.

SEC. 7-3-5:  Due Notice

(a) Except where otherwise provided in this Chapter, “due notice” shall consist of personal service to owners of record of the real estate involved, or by registered mail sent to the last known address of such owner or owners, by posting such notice in the registered mail, postage prepaid.

(b) Whenever, upon diligent search, the identity or whereabouts of such owner or owners shall not be ascertainable, notice mailed to the person or persons in whose name such real estate was last assessed shall constitute sufficient notice.

SEC. 7-3-6:  Public Notice of Unsafe Building

(a) Whenever any building or structure is found to be unsafe for occupancy, or detrimental to the public welfare and safety, the Building Administrator shall post or cause to be posted at each entrance to such building or structure a notice to read “DO NOT ENTER, UNSAFE TO OCCUPY, BUILDING ADMINISTRATOR, CITY OF KNOXVILLE, ILLINOIS.”

(b) Such notice shall remain posted until such repairs, improvements, demolition or removal has been completed, and no notice so posted shall be removed without written permission by the Building Administrator or the City Council and no person shall enter such building or structure, except for the purpose of making the required repairs, inspection, demolition or removal of the said building.  Violation of this Section shall be a misdemeanor punishable by the fines set forth in Section 7-5-1 of this Chapter. 

SEC. 7-3-7:  Failure of Owner to Abate

In the event the owner or owners of any unsafe building, after fifteen-days' written notice, have neglected, refused or otherwise failed to put such building in a safe condition or to demolish it, the City Council may make or cause to be made application to the Circuit Court of Knox County, in the manner as provided by statute, for an order authorizing the City to demolish or repair, or cause the demolition or repair, of dangerous and unsafe building or uncompleted and abandoned building.  Thereafter, the City, or any contractor employed by the City, may, to the fullest extent provided by statute, recover from the owner or owners the costs to repair or demolish the building, and/or perfect a lien on the property for said costs.  Remedies in this Section are cumulative to all other remedies available to the City under this Chapter, including, but not limited to, the imposition of fines and penalties as provided in Section 7-5-1 of this Chapter.
SEC. 7-3-8:  Expedited Appeal of Notice to Abate or Notice of Unsafe Building 


The following determinations of the Building Administrator shall be subject to an expedited appeal at the written request of any owner or person in control of any unsafe building or structure that is the subject of the determination:

(a)
The determination to issue a notice to abate, or the terms and deadlines of corrective action required by a notice to abate, where said notice to abate is issued pursuant to Section 7-3-4 of this Chapter; or

(b)
The determination to post a public notice pursuant to Section 7-3-6 of the Chapter; or 

(c)
The refusal of the Building Administrator to allow the entrance of person or persons into an unsafe building after the posting of a public notice pursuant to Section 7-3-6 of this Chapter.


All other determinations of the Building Administrator shall be subject to the normal appeal process set forth in Article 5 of this Chapter.


To initiate such an expedited appeal, the owner or person in control of the unsafe building or structure shall file, with the City Clerk or City Collector, a written appeal request.  The written appeal request must state that an expedited appeal is requested.  The written appeal request must be signed and provide the appellant’s name, address, telephone number, address of the unsafe building, and the determination or action from which appeal is sought.  The written appeal request must be filed within five (5) business days of the action or determination.


Within seven (7) days of receipt of the written appeal request, the City Council shall hold a hearing and render a final decision.  To the extent practical under the expedited appeal schedule, the City Council shall follow the procedures set forth in Sections 7-5-7 and 7-5-8 of this Chapter. 

ARTICLE 4:  Appointment and Powers of Building Administrator
SEC. 7-4-1:  Appointment and Compensation of Building Administrator

The Mayor, with the advice and consent of the City Council, shall appoint a Building Administrator for the City of Knoxville, Illinois.  Any Building Administrator appointed before the adoption of this Chapter, as revised, shall continue in such position without need of a new appointment.  

The Building Administrator shall serve an indeterminate term, not to exceed the term of the Mayor, performing duties as reasonably needed or assigned, from time to time, by the Mayor and City Council, and shall receive such compensation, at an hourly rate, set by the City Council from time to time, provided that nothing in this Chapter shall prohibit the adoption of a resolution to pay the Building Administrator a set salary.  Nothing in this Chapter shall prohibit the removal of the Building Administrator, with or without cause, and the appointment of a successor Building Administrator.

SEC. 7-4-2:  Appointment of Deputy and Acting Building Administrators

The Building Administrator, with the consent of the Mayor, may appoint one or more deputy building administrators to assist the Building Administrator in the performance of his or her duties, during any time period which the Building Administrator is unavailable to perform said duties.  Such deputy building administrators shall receive compensation at the hourly rate set, from time to time, by the City Council.  Such deputy building administrators shall exercise all the responsibilities and powers of the Building Administrator as set forth in this Chapter.

Should the Building Administrator be unavailable or abandon the duties of his or her office, and the Mayor determines, in his or her sole discretion, that the services of an acting building administrator is required to protect the public and enforce the provisions of this Chapter, the Mayor may appoint an acting building administrator, who shall exercise all the responsibilities and powers of the Building Administrator as set forth in this Chapter, provided further, the Mayor shall report such decision to the City Council within 30 days of appointment of the acting building administrator, at which time the City Council may vote (i) to ratify or reverse any actions of the acting building administrator.  At such time as he makes said report, the Mayor may also nominate the acting building administrator to serve as Building Administrator, pursuant to the procedures for appointing a Building Inspector set forth in Section 7-3-1 of this Chapter.

SEC. 7-4-3:  Powers and Responsibilities of the Building Administrator

The Building Administrator is authorized and directed to enforce all provisions of this Chapter, including specifically, those portions of the IBC, the IRC and other codes adopted by reference. In carrying out these responsibilities, the Building Administrator shall, as he or she deems necessary, consult with and consider the suggestions of other departments, employees and officers of the City, including, but not limited to, the public works department, the City Engineer and City Attorney.  The Building Administrator may also confer with the Fire Protection District and consider its recommendations with respect to whether any permit required by this Chapter should issue.  The Building Administrator may investigate any violation of this Chapter, either upon complaint or upon his or her own initiative.  The Building Administrator may, upon probable cause and in concert with the City Attorney, apply to the Circuit Court for such administrative warrants as may be necessary to investigate violations of this Chapter.  The Building Administrator, upon request of the City Attorney, shall testify and present evidence regarding violations of this Chapter.   

ARTICLE 5:  Penalties, Enforcement and Appeals

SEC. 7-5-1:  Enforcement of Codes and Penalties for Violations

Any person who shall violate any provision of this Chapter or shall fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof (including the requirements of any code adopted by reference by this Chapter) or who shall erect, construct, alter, demolish or repair a building or structure in violation of an approved plan or directive of the Building Administrator or a permit or certificate issued under the provisions of this Code shall be guilty of a misdemeanor punishable by a fine under the penalty provisions of Section 1-1-11 for each offense.  Each day that a violation continues shall be deemed a separate offense. 

SEC. 7-5-2:  Penalty Does Not Excuse Violations

The imposition of a penalty hereunder shall not excuse the violation nor shall it permit the continuance of any such violation.  Failure to take corrective action, even after the imposition of a penalty, may result in the imposition of additional fines or penalties for each day the violation continues.

SEC. 7-5-3:  Penalty in Addition to Correction

The penalty herein provided shall be in addition to any correction, removal, demolition or destruction order that may be entered.  In addition to imposing financial penalties, the City may petition the Circuit Court of Knox County, Illinois for injunctive relief to prevent, remedy or correct any violation of this Chapter or to enjoin occupancy, construction, alteration, demolition or use of any building or residence in violation of this Chapter.

SEC. 7-5-4:  Administrative Fine in Lieu of Prosecution

The Building Administrator, at his sole discretion, or any Knoxville police officer acting under the Building Administrator’s advice or direction, may issue an Administrative Warning Ticket (AWT), provided that if the person issued said AWT does not pay the Administration Fee, and correct all violations of this Chapter, within fifteen (15) days of receipt of the AWT, then a Complaint shall issue against said person, and said person shall be subject to all fines set forth in Section 7-5-1 of this Chapter, as well as all other remedies available the City under this Chapter. The amount of the Administration Fee shall be as set, from time to time, by the City Council, but in no case shall said Administration Fee be less than Seventy-five dollars ($75.00) for any violation of this Chapter. The form of the AWT issued for a violation of this Chapter shall be substantially as approved, from time to time, by the City Council, but it shall not be a defense to any violation of this Chapter that the form of any AWT issued was incorrect or differed from the AWT approved by the City Council.  

EXHIBIT A TO ORDINANCE

Knoxville Building Administrator
Ticket No. 




State of Illinois

)

County of Knox
)

CITY ORDINANCE/ADMINISTRATIVE WARNING TICKET

	Defendant Information:

Name











     LAST

     FIRST


M.I.

Address









City




 State

 ZIP



	Date of Offense  
/
/20




         MM/DD/Year 

Note that each date the offense remains uncorrected may constitute a separate offense subject to additional fines. 



	Location of Offense:  











           In Knoxville, Illinois.

	Defendant Did Unlawfully Commit the Following Violations(s):


  Construction Without  Building Permit, Sec. 7-2-1 


  Demolition or Removal of Principal Building without a permit, Sec. 7-2-4 


  Construction, Demolition or Removal after permit expires, Sec. 7-2-7


  Fence Construction without a valid permit, Sec. 7-2-8


  Swimming pool construction or erection without a permit, Sec. 7-2-12


  Building Code Violation, Sec. 7-5-1 (describe):


  Other:








All violations carry a fine of $75.00 if paid within 15 days.  The fine is payable to the CITY OF KNOXVILLE, IL at 33 N. Public Square, Knoxville, IL.  IF THE FINE IS NOT PAID WITHIN 15 DAYS, A COURT COMPLAINT SHALL ISSUE, AND IF YOU ARE FOUND GUILTY BY THE COURT, YOU MAY BE REQUIRED TO PAY THE MAXIMUM FINE PROVIDED BY ORDINANCE, PLUS ALL COURT COSTS.  Payment of the fine does not excuse the failure to obtain a permit or correct building code violations.  Corrective work and/or obtaining a permit may be required in addition to the above fine, and the failure to correct or abate the violation may subject you to additional fines.  



	Pursuant to Section 1-109 of the Code of Civil Procedure, the Undersigned Code Enforcement Officer states, on oath, that the information contained in the foregoing instrument is true and correct.

Date:  

/
/20









 


     MM/DD/Year




        Building Administrator


SEC. 7-5-5:  Right of Appeal

Except for violations subject to a Complaint which has been filed in a court of competent jurisdiction, any owner, operator or occupant who is aggrieved with the ruling or decision of the Building Administrator or in any matter relative to the interpretation or enforcement of any provisions of this Chapter (including those building codes or standards this Chapter incorporates by reference) may appeal the decision or interpretation to the City Council of the City of Knoxville, Illinois.  Provided, where a building has been declared unsafe or unfit for occupancy, pursuant to Article 3 of this Chapter, and the determination of the Building Administrator is eligible under Section 7-3-8 for the expedited appeal process, the expedited appeal process set forth in said Section 7-3-8 shall control the appeal process and the deadline for appeal.

SEC. 7-5-6:  Notice of Appeal


The appellant shall file his notice to appeal with the Office of the City Clerk or the Office of the City Collector at least thirty days in advance of the general meeting at which the appeal is to be considered by the City Council.  Any appeal must be taken within thirty days from the date of the decision in question.  The Building Administrator shall forthwith transmit to the City Council all the papers pertinent to the appeal.


The notice of appeal shall be in writing, signed by the appellant, and shall include:

A.
The name, address and telephone number of the appellant;

B.
A legal description and address of the property involved;

C.
A brief description of the decision in question;

D.
The reason or reasons given by the Building Administrator for violation of this Chapter and any part herein; and

E.
The grounds on which the appeal is being made.

SEC. 7-5-7:  Appeal Procedure


A.  The City Council shall consider the appeal within thirty days after the notice of appeal has been filed with the City Clerk or City Collector.  Failure of the City Council to consider the appeal at such time shall not have the effect of a decision in favor of the aggrieved party.  The City Council, at its sole discretion, may hear evidence concerning the appeal or may require that the appellant submit additional materials.  The rules of procedure during a hearing on an appeal shall be similar to the procedures of trial of civil matters in the courts of this state except where convenience and necessity require variance therefrom.  The formal rules of evidence shall not apply, but all evidence that is relevant and material and of probative value shall be admitted.  Hearsay evidence alone shall not support any decision of the City Council.


B. All appeal proceedings shall be recorded by the City Clerk.  All appeal proceedings shall be presided over by the Mayor or his delegate.  The Mayor or City Council may request the assistance of the City Attorney.  The Mayor shall rule on issues or procedure, provided that procedural rulings of the Mayor may be overruled by a majority of the City Council.  All questions of fact shall be determined by the City Council.  

SEC. 7-5-8:  City Council Decisions


A.  Every decision of the City Council shall be made at a public meeting.  Every decision of the City Council shall be made within a reasonable time from the date of the conclusion of the presentation of materials and evidence relating to the appeal, but in any event, not later than thirty days after the conclusion of the proceedings.


B.  Every decision of the City Council shall be in writing and shall be promptly sent to the Building Administrator.  A copy of the decision shall be sent by mail or otherwise to the appellant.


C.  It is the responsibility of the City Council to make fact findings and to review the findings of the Building Administrator and other officials, provided that fact findings of the Building Administrator shall be presumed to be correct until rebutted by a preponderance of the evidence to the contrary.  Except in the case of a tie, the Mayor shall not vote on the decision. 


D.  The City Council may extend any time allowance provided in this Chapter or as established by the Building Administrator.  The City Council may grant a variance from the provisions of this Chapter upon an owner, renter or lessee, upon presentation of evidence of substantial economic hardship in cases where property and the health and safety of persons are not endangered by physical injury or damage, and where enforcement of the code provision, in the circumstances supported by evidence would constitute a confiscation of property without compensation contrary to the Constitution of the United States of America and of the State of Illinois.  The City Council may not waive a violation of this Chapter; it may only vary the time of compliance.


E.  A decision of the City Council to extend any time allowance provided in this Chapter and/or to grant a variance from provisions of this Chapter, or to modify an order of the Building Administrator, shall specify in what manner such extension, variation, or modification is made, the conditions upon which it is made, and the reasons therefor.


F.  The City Council shall reverse the decision of the Building Administrator when the City Council determines that the true intent of this Chapter has been incorrectly interpreted or the provisions of this Chapter do not fully apply.


G.  If a decision of the City Council reverses the order of the Building Administrator, he or she shall take action immediately in accordance with the decision of the City Council.  No matter heard by the City Council and upon which a decision has been rendered once shall be again reviewed by the City Council.

ARTICLE 6:  Severability
SEC. 7-6-1:  Severability


Should any section or provision of this Chapter (including any section or provision of any building code adopted herein by reference) be declared by a court of competent jurisdiction to be invalid, that decision shall not affect the validity of the ordinance as a whole or any part thereof, other than the part so declared to be invalid.

	
	City of Knoxville 
	
	
	
	

	
	PROPOSED Building Permit Fees 
	
	
	
	

	
	2017
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	Ordinance 2016-06
	
	Proposed Changes per

	
	
	
	Categories
	
	Building Code Ordinance
	
	Building Administrator

	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	1
	
	Residential garages (attached or detached)
	
	$0.10 per sq ft
	
	$0.20 per sq ft

	
	2
	
	Residences (with unfinished basement)
	
	$0.10 per sq ft
	
	$0.20 per sq ft

	
	3
	
	Residences (with finished basement)
	
	$0.15 per sq ft
	
	$0.20 per sq ft

	
	4


	
	Single and Two Family residences / finished basement 

/ converting garages /attic to living space
	$0.05 per sq ft


	
	$0.10 per sq ft



	
	5
	
	Commercial buildings (finished for retail/office, etc)
	
	$0.10 per sq ft
	
	N/C

	
	6
	
	Warehouses (pole type)
	
	$0.10 per sq ft
	
	$0.20 per sq ft

	
	7


	
	Any attached appurtenance to any of the above

buildings - square foot price for type of use

minimum fee $5.00 
	$0.10 per sq ft



	
	8
	
	Fence Construction (at Building InspectorS discretion)
	
	$25.00 
	
	$50.00 

	
	9
	
	Swimming pools in or above ground
	
	$25.00 
	
	N/C

	
	10
	
	Residential decks / ramps / porches
	
	$0.10 per sq ft
	
	$25.00 per linear foot *

	
	11
	
	Utility Shed (less than 150 sq ft)
	
	$25.00 
	
	N/C

	
	12


	
	Single and Two Family residences / finished basement 

/ converting garages /attic to living space
	$0.05 per sq ft


	
	N/C



	
	13


	
	Single and two family residence unfinished basement


	
	$0.10 per sq ft


	
	No Longer applicable, 

remove

	
	14


	Multi-family residential building (not including 

basement unless finished for living space)


	$15.00 for 1st $1,000 cost

and $5.00 for each $1,000 

or fraction thereof
	N/C



	
	15


	Commercial an Institutional buildings when 

finished for retail or office use.


	$15.00 for 1st $1,000 cost

and $5.00 for each $1,000 

or fraction thereof
	N/C



	
	16


	Nonresidential change of use or remodel


	
	$15.00 for 1st $1,000 cost

and $5.00 for each $1,000 

or fraction thereof
	N/C



	
	17


	Warehouse and industrial buildings when primarily unfinished


	$15.00 for 1st $1,000 cost

and $5.00 for each $1,000 

or fraction thereof
	N/C



	
	18


	
	Moveable structure on fixed foundation

minimum fee $10.00 
	$0.05 per sq ft


	
	$100.00 **



	
	19
	
	Sign
	
	$25.00 
	
	N/C

	
	20


	
	Demolition or removal permit fee 50% of the then

current building permit fee for that structure
	
	N/C



	
	21
	
	Failure to secure permit fine
	
	$50.00 
	
	N/C

	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	* Changed when 2012 Building Code was adopted.
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	** Police Department involvement is be required.
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	 
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	


